

19
to: ...
auditor
Eng.

D

OT

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS, AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF SPRINKLER HEADS & CONTROLLERS, CLASS 200 PVC PLAIN END PIPE, PVC FITTINGS, GALVANIZED FITTINGS, CONTROL & COMMON WIRE AND TAPPED COUPLINGS, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, FOR USE BY THE CITY OF ABILENE.

WHEREAS, the City of Abilene duly advertised, and gave such notice, as required by law, for bids for the purchase of sprinkler heads & controllers, class 200 PVC plain end pipe, PVC fittings, galvanized fittings, control & common wire and tapped couplings, meeting specifications, for use by the City of Abilene; and,

WHEREAS, the following bids were received and opened on the 16th day of March, 1971:

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Goldthwaite's of Texas sprinkler heads & controllers	\$10,822.92
Western Plumbing Wholesalers class 200 PVC plain end pipe PVC fittings galvanized fittings tapped couplings	\$ 1,633.64 \$ 647.05 \$ 888.12 \$ 802.38
Telco Industries control & common wire	\$ 2,509.65

WHEREAS, it is the opinion of the City Council that the bids of Goldthwaite's of Texas, Western Plumbing Wholesalers and Telco Industries for the above amounts shown, are the lowest and best responsible bids, meeting specifications, and should be accepted; now, therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE,

TEXAS:

PART 1: That the bids of the above companies for the purchases of the above described sprinkler system materials and for the amounts shown be, and the same are hereby, in all things, approved and accepted.

PART 2: That the sum of Seventeen Thousand Three Hundred Three and 76/100ths (\$17,303.76) Dollars be, and is hereby appropriated from Park Bond Funds for such equipment.

PART 3: That this resolution shall take effect immediately from and after its passage.

CITY OF ABILENE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT TABULATION OF BIDS	DEPARTMENT: PARKS & RECREATION		TIME OF OPENING 1:30 P. M.	DATE OF OPENING March 16, 1971
	WESTERN PLUMBING WHOLESALEERS	COLONIAL MOTORS	VENEABLE SPRINKLER SALES	GOLDTHWAITE'S OF TEXAS
MOBILEY COMPANY	TELSCO INDUSTRIES			

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	Sprinkler Heads & Controllers	No Bid	No Bid	10,822 92	No Bid	No Bid
2	Class 200 PVC Plain End Pipe	1,666 98	No Bid	2,061 47	2,550 03	2,144 18
3	PVC Fittings	660 26	No Bid	664 55	792 87	699 53
4	Galvanized Fittings	906 24	No Bid	915 68	1,335 76	No Bid
5	Control & Common Wire	3,071 40	No Bid	3,290 00	3,136 55	2,535 00
6	Tapped Couplings	818 76	No Bid	849 34	815 09	No Bid
	DELIVERY	10 days	20 days	7-21 days	10 days	
	TERMS	2% - 10 days	Net	Net - 10th	1% - 10 days	Net - 30 days

Recommended purchase of Item 1 is the bid of Goldthwaite's \$10,822.92.

Recommended purchase of Item 2 is the low bid of Western Plumbing Wholesalers \$1,633.64.

Recommended purchase of Item 3 is the low bid of Western Plumbing Wholesalers \$ 647.05.

Recommended purchase of Item 4 is the low bid of Western Plumbing Wholesalers \$ 888.12.

Recommended purchase of Item 5 is the low bid of Telco Industries \$2,509.65.

Bill Beard
Director Parks & Recreation

Bernard Huett

PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
ERN 3ING VALERS	COLONIAL MOTORS	VENABLE SPRINKLER SALES	GOLDTHWAITE'S OF TEXAS	TELSCO INDUSTRIES	MOBILEY COMPANY
666 98	660 26	906 24	071 40	318 76	
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2,061 47	664 55	915 68	3,290 00	849 34	815 09
2,550 03	792 87	1,335 76	3,136 55	20 days	Net - 10th
2,144 18	699 53	No Bid	2,535 00	10 days	Net - 7-21 days
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1% - 10 days	Net - 10th
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Net - 30 days	Net
No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10,822 92		

id of Goldthwaite's \$10,822.92.
 bid of Western Plumbing Wholesalers \$1,633.64.
 bid of Western Plumbing Wholesalers \$ 647.05.
 bid of Western Plumbing Wholesalers \$ 888.12.
 bid of Telasco Industries \$2,509.65.

Bill Beard
 Bill Beard
 Director Parks & Recreation
 Bernard Huett