

Copies to: W-15
Purchasing
Auditing
acct.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS, AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF ONE MILLION FOUR HUNDRED THOUSAND (1,400,000) LBS. LIQUEFIED CHLORINE GAS; SEVEN HUNDRED THOUSAND (700,000) LBS. LIQUEFIED ALUMINUM SULPHATE; THREE HUNDRED FIFTY THOUSAND (350,000) LBS. GROUND ALUMINUM SULPHATE; TWO HUNDRED THOUSAND (200,000) LBS. PEBBLE QUICKLIME; THREE MILLION (3,000,000) LBS. BULK QUICKLIME; FORTY THOUSAND (40,000) LBS. ACTIVATED CARBON BULK TRUCK DELIVERY; FORTY THOUSAND (40,000) LBS. ACTIVATED CARBON BULK HOPPER CAR DELIVERY; TWENTY THOUSAND (20,000) LBS. COPPER SULPHATE; AND TWENTY-FOUR THOUSAND (24,000) LBS. SODIUM HEXAMETA- PHOSPHATE; MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, FOR USE BY THE CITY OF ABILENE.

WHEREAS, the City of Abilene duly advertised and gave such notice as required by law for bids for the purchase of one million four hundred thousand (1,400,000) lbs. liquefied chlorine gas; seven hundred thousand (700,000) lbs. liquefied aluminum sulphate; three hundred fifty thousand (350,000) lbs. ground aluminum sulphate; two hundred thousand (200,000) lbs. pebble quicklime; three million (3,000,000) lbs. bulk quicklime; forty thousand (40,000) lbs. activated carbon bulk truck delivery; forty thousand (40,000) lbs. activated carbon bulk hopper car delivery; twenty thousand (20,000) lbs. copper sulphate; and twenty-four thousand (24,000) lbs. sodium hexametaphosphate; meeting specifications, for use by the City of Abilene; and,

WHEREAS, the following bids were received and opened on the 29th day of February, 1972:

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Sax, Inc.	
1,400,000 lbs. liquefied chlorine gas.....	\$51,800.00
Stauffer Chemical Company	
700,000 lbs. liquefied aluminum sulphate....	\$21,297.50
McKesson Chemical Company	
350,000 lbs. ground aluminum sulphate.....	\$14,700.00
40,000 lbs. activated carbon bulk truck delivery.....	\$ 3,200.00
40,000 lbs. activated carbon bulk hopper car delivery.....	\$ 3,200.00
20,000 lbs. copper sulphate.....	\$ 5,198.00
24,000 lbs. sodium hexametaphosphate.....	\$ 3,276.00

BIDDER

AMOUNT

Austin White Lime Company
 200,000 lbs. pebble quicklime.....\$ 3,180.00

Chemical Lime, Inc.
 3,000,000 lbs. bulk quicklime.....\$31,350.00

WHEREAS, it is the opinion of the City Council that the bids of the above companies for the above amounts shown, are the lowest and best responsible bids, meeting specifications, and should be accepted; now, therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS:

PART 1: That the bids of the above companies for the purchases of the above described water treatment chemicals and for the amounts shown be, and the same are hereby, in all things, approved and accepted.

PART 2: That the Purchasing Agent be, and he is hereby, authorized to make such purchases from said companies.

PART 3: That this resolution shall take effect immediately from and after its passage.

ADOPTED this the 9th day of March, A. D. 1972.

ATTEST:

Burt H. Hodgin
 CITY SECRETARY

J. C. Spang
 MAYOR

APPROVED: Ben Pridemore
 CITY ATTORNEY

MAR 10 1972

**CITY OF ABILENE, TEX.
PURCHASING DEPT.**

TABULATION OF BIDS

DEPARTMENT:

Water Department

TIME OF OPENING:

1:30 P.M.

DATE OF OPENING:

February 29, 1972

McKesson Chemical
Company

Stauffer Chemical
Company

Texas Lime Company

Thompson-Hayward
Chemical Co.

Sax, Inc.

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.
1	1,400,000 lbs Liquefied Chlorine Gas	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5 90	74 00
2	700,000 lbs Liquefied Aluminum sulphate	No Bid	60 85 21,297 50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	350,000 lbs Ground Aluminum Sulphate	4 20 14,700 00	80 65 14,113 75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	200,000 lbs Pebble Quicklime	No Bid	No Bid	30 80 3,080 00	No Bid	No Bid
5	3,000,000 lbs Bulk Quicklime	No Bid	No Bid	All or none 22 90 34,350 00	No Bid	No Bid
6	40,000 lbs. Activated Carbon Bulk truck delivery	160 00 3,200 00	No Bid	No Bid	190 00 3,800 00	No Bid
7	40,000 lbs. Activated Carbon Bulk hopper car delivery	160 00 3,200 00	No Bid	No Bid	185 00 3,700 00	No Bid
8	20,000 lbs Copper Sulphate	25 99 5,198 00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	24,000 lbs Sodium Hexametaphosphate	13 65 3,276 00	No Bid	No Bid	14 90 3,576 00	No Bid

TERMS

Net

Net

Net-30days Net-30days

Net

DELIVERY

Prompt

7 days

Bag-2 days & days

1 day

Bulk-1 day

TABULATED & PREPARED BY:

DATE OF AWARD:

AWARDED TO:

**CITY OF ABILENE, TEX.
PURCHASING DEPT.**

TABULATION OF BIDS

DEPARTMENT: Water Department

TIME OF OPENING: 1:30 P.M. DATE OF OPENING: February 29, 1972

Lion Hardware

Austin White Lime Company

Roundrock Lime Company

Vulcan Materials Company

Chemical Lime, Inc.

Frontier Chemical Company

Diamond Alkali Company

Residual Charges

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.
1	1,400,000 lbs Liquefied Chlorine Gas	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	124.20	No Bid	No Bid
2	700,000 lbs Liquefied Aluminum Sulphate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	86,940.00	No Bid	No Bid
3	350,000 lbs. Ground Aluminum Sulphate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	200,000 lbs. pebble Quicklime	No Bid	31 80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	3,000,000 lbs. bulk Quicklime		3,180.00	21 70	22 20	No Bid	20 90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	40,000 lbs. Activated Carbon bulk truck delivery	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	40,000 lbs. Activated Carbon bulk hopper car delivery	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	20,000 lbs. Copper Sulphate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	24,000 lbs. Sodium Hexametaphosphate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

TERMS DELIVERY Net as requested Net 1 day Net 3 days Net 1 d

TABULATED & PREPARED BY: DATE OF AWARD: AWARDED TO:

The recommended purchase of Item 1 is the low bid of Sax, Inc. \$51,800.00

The recommended purchase of Item 2 is the low bid of Stauffer Chemical Company \$21,297.00

The recommended purchase of Item 3 is the bid of McKesson Chemical Company \$14,700.00
stacked in warehouse.

The recommended purchase of Item 4 is the low bid of Austin White Lime Company \$3,180.00


The recommended purchase of Item 5 is the bid of Chemical Lime, Inc. 31,350.00 (Drawn by
Council)


The recommended purchase of Item 6 is the low bid of McKesson Chemical Company \$3,200.00

The recommended purchase of Item 7 is the low bid of McKesson Chemical Company \$3,200.00

The recommended purchase of Item 8 is the low bid of McKesson Chemical Company \$5,198.00

The recommended purchase of Item 9 is the low bid of McKesson Chemical Company \$3,276.00


Bill Weems
Water Superintendent


Bernard Huett
Purchasing Agent