

copy to:
Acct.
audit
purchase
W & S

20

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS,
AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS, MEETING
SPECIFICATIONS, FOR USE BY THE CITY OF ABILENE.

WHEREAS, the City of Abilene duly advertised and gave such notice, as
required by law, for bids for the purchase of water treatment chemicals, meeting
specifications, for use by the City of Abilene; and,

WHEREAS, the following bids were received and opened on the 1st day of

June, 1976:

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Carroll Chemical	
Item 1: 350 tons liquid chlorine	\$77,423.50
Thompson-Hayward	
Item 2: 20 tons activated carbon	\$ 8,875.00
Stauffer Chemical	
Item 3: 40 tons liquid alum	\$ 3,629.60
<u>Texas Lime</u> (tie bid)	
Item 4: 1900 tons bulk lime	\$81,320.00
Van Waters & Rogers	
Item 5: 6 tons (glass form) sodium hexametaphosphate	\$ 3,528.00
American Cyanamid	
Item 6: 30,000 lbs. polyelectrolytes	\$16,350.00

WHEREAS, it is the opinion of the City Council that the bids of the above companies
for the above amounts shown, are the lowest and best responsible bids, meeting
specifications, and should be accepted; now, therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS:

PART 1: That the bids of the above companies for the purchases of the above
described water treatment chemicals, and for the amounts shown, be, and the same
are hereby, in all things, approved and accepted.

PART 2: That the Purchasing Agent be, and he is hereby authorized to make
such purchases from said companies.

PART 3: That this resolution shall take effect immediately from and after its passage.

ADOPTED this 10th day of June, A.D. 1976.

ATTEST:

Ruth Hodgins
CITY SECRETARY

John C. Kelly
MAYOR

APPROVED:

Philip J. Wetherbee
ASSISZANT CITY ATTORNEY

CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS
PURCHASING DEPT.

Tabulation of Bids

DEPARTMENT

Water Dept.

TIME OF OPENING

DATE OF OPENING

1:30 p.m.

June 1, 1976

Abilene Chemical Supply
Abilene, Texas

Texas Lime Company
Cleburne, Texas

Calgon Corporation
Menard, Texas

American Cyanamid
West Wego, LA

Nalco Chemical
Odessa, TX

Arkla Chemical Corp
Shreveport, Louisiana

Diamond Alkali Co.
Houston, Texas

Frontier Chemical
Wichita, Kansas

Van Water & Rogers
Dallas, Texas

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.
1	350 tons Liquid Chlorine	NO-BID	N/B	N/B	N/B	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	N/B
2	20 tons Activated Carbon		N/B	N/B	N/B					N/B
3	40 tons Liquid Alum		N/B	N/B	N/B					N/B
4	1900 tons Bulk Lime		42 80	N/B	N/B					N/B
			81,320 00							
5	6 tons (Glass Form) Sodium Hexametaphosphate		N/B	N/B	N/B					29 40 cwt
										3,528 00
6	30,000 lbs. Polyelectrolytes		N/B	T .3931/lb	.575C .405 drum					N/B
				11,793 00	12,150 00					
	Delivery		1 Day	A .3342/lb	.345 Bulk					5 days
				10,026 00	10,350 00					
				Alternate Bid Bulk	Alt. Bid 1-5770					
				T .3084/lb	1.545 drum					
				12,336.00	15,350.00					
				A .2423/lb	.475 Bulk					
				9,692.00	14,250.00					

DO NOT WISH TO BID AT THIS TIME

NOT IN POSITION TO MEET REQUIREMENTS

** See Attached

Del. 10 days 10 days

TABULATED & PREPARED BY:	DATE OF AWARD:	AWARDED TO:
--------------------------	----------------	-------------

CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS
PURCHASING DEPT.

Tabulation of Bids

DEPARTMENT

Water Dept.

TIME OF OPENING

DATE OF OPENING

1:30 p.m.

June 1, 1976

Husky Industries
Dunnellon, Florida

Ashland Chemical
Dallas, Texas

Atlantes Chemical
Fort Worth, Texas

Allied Chemicals
Houston, Texas

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.
1	350 tons Liquid Chlorine	NO BID	NO BID	N/B	NO BID	THE RECOMMENDED PURCHASE OF ITEM 1 IS THE LOW BID OF CARROLL CHEMICAL. \$77,423.50.			
2	20 tons Activated Carbon			N/B		THE RECOMMENDED PURCHASE OF ITEM 2 IS THE BID OF THOMPSON-HAYWARD \$6,875.00			
3	40 tons Liquid Alum			N/B		THE RECOMMENDED PURCHASE OF ITEM 3 IS THE BID OF STAUFFER CHEMICAL \$3,629.60.			
4	1900 tons Bulk Lime			N/B		ITEM 4 IS A DRAW BETWEEN AUSTIN WHITE LIME AND TEXAS LIME CO. \$81,320.00			
5	6 tons (Glass Form) Sodium Hexametaphosphate			34.50 CWT		THE RECOMMENDED PURCHASE OF ITEM 5 IS THE LOW BID OF VAN WATERS & ROGERS \$3,528.00			
6	30,000 lbs. Polyelectrolytes			N/B		THE RECOMMENDED PURCHASE OF ITEM 6 IS THE BEST BID OF AMERICAN CYANAMID \$16,350.00			
	Delivery			5 days					

"PLEASE KEEP US ON FOR FUTURE INQUIRIES"

W. J. Weems

Director of Water & Sewer

Bernard Huett

Purchasing Agent

TABULATED & PREPARED BY:

DATE OF AWARD:

AWARDED TO: