

Copy to: Page 24  
City of Abilene  
Traffic

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS, AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE OF TRAFFIC SIGN MATERIALS, MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, FOR USE BY THE CITY OF ABILENE.

WHEREAS, the City of Abilene duly advertised and gave notice, as required by law, for bids for the purchase of traffic sign materials, for use by the City of Abilene; and,

WHEREAS, the following bids were received and opened on the 1st day of February, A.D. 1977.

BIDDER AMOUNT

Minnesota Mining

1 roll heat-activated engineer-grade reflective sheeting \$ 102.30  
unmounted upper case cut-out letters and numbers \$ 332.50  
pre-screen sign faces \$ 709.70

Traffic Supplies, Inc.

pre-screened sign faces \$6,098.80  
pre-screened standard-size street name faces \$2,573.96  
street name mounting brackets (low bid) \$2,282.00

Vulcan Signs & Stamping, Inc.

aluminum sign blanks (alternate bid) \$4,351.32  
flat alum. street name sign blanks (alternate bid) \$2,067.80

Ve Ped Traffic Controls

aluminum post clamp sets for mounting flat signs on tubular posts \$ 620.00

Dave Smith & Co.

2 3/8" outside dia. galvanized pipe post (low bid) \$6,315.00

WHEREAS, it is the opinion of the City Council that the bids of the above companies for the amounts shown, are the lowest and best responsible bids, meeting specifications, and should be accepted; now, therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS:

PART 1: That the bids of the above companies for the purchases of the above described traffic sign materials, and for the amounts shown be, and the same are hereby, in all things, approved and accepted.

PART 2: That the Purchasing Agent be, and he is hereby authorized to make such purchases from said companies.

PART 3: That this resolution shall take effect immediately from and after its passage.

ADOPTED this 10th day of February, A.D. 1977.

ATTEST:

Paul Hodgin  
CITY SECRETARY

[Signature]  
MAYOR

APPROVED:  
[Signature]  
CITY ATTORNEY

Bid #196

CITY OF ABILENE, TEXAS  
PURCHASING DEPT.

Tabulation of Bids

DEPARTMENT  
Traffic Engineering

TIME OF OPENING: 1:30 PM  
DATE OF OPENING: February 1, 1977

Ve Ped Traffic Controls  
Oklahoma City, OK

Dave Smith & Co.  
Ft. Lauderdale, FL

FSC Sales  
Arlington, TX

Traffic Supplies  
Oklahoma City, OK

Vulcan Signs & Stamping, Inc.  
Foley, Alabama

Hall Sign & Post  
Bloomington, Indiana

THE RECOMMENDED PURCHASES ARE:

ITEM	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.	U.P.
1	Aluminum sign blanks	6969 52	7792 04	5083 36	5490 22	5356 74	4579 46	4579 46	4579 46	4579 46	Item 1 low alternate bid of
	Item #1 Alternate			4667 26		4351 32					Vulcan \$4,351.32
2	Flat alum. st. name sign blanks	3372 60	No Bid	2514 62	2481 96	2516 62	2256 70	2256 70	2256 70	2256 70	Item 2 low alternate bid of
	Item #2 Alternate			2301 50		2067 80					Vulcan \$2,067.80
3	Street name mounting brackets	2975 00	2793 00	2499 00	2282 00	2534 00	2590 00	2590 00	2590 00	2590 00	Item 3 low base bid of Traffic
	Item #3 Alternate			1806 00							Supplies \$2,282.00
4	Alum. post clampsets for mounting flat signs on tubular posts	620 00	11240 00	1680 00	680 00	800 00	1900 00	1900 00	1900 00	1900 00	Item 4 low bid of Ve Ped \$620.00
	Item 5 low base bid of Dave Smith										\$6,315.00
5	2 3/8" outside diameter galvanized pipe post	7590 00	6315 00	No Bid	8442 00	7961 00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
5a	ALTERNATE BID: 0.080 inch min. wall thickness, 2.0016 min. weight per foot	No Bid	10666 00	10497 00	13981 00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Wayne Kurfes, Director of Traffic
	Total	21,527 12	28,806 04	22,273 98	33,357 18	19,168 00	11,326 16	11,326 16	11,326 16	11,326 16	Bernard Huet, Purchasing Agent
	Delivery	90 Days	30-60 days	30-45 Days	45-60 Days	30-60 Days					
	Discount	NET 30	1% 10 days	NET 30	NET						

TABULATED & PREPARED BY: \_\_\_\_\_ DATE OF AWARD: \_\_\_\_\_ AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_